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SWIMMING POOL HAS TOUGH TIME 
BREAKING EVEN; RATES TO RISE 

by Vlrginia Beauchamp 
Despite several changes in policy 

that resulted in lowered revenues 
for the municipal swimming pool 
during the 1970 season, the pool 
operation apparently broke even. 
Lest year, when the 1971 budget 
was adopted, the pool was project­
ed to make a profit of $1,280-
necessary to meet a sharply in­
creasing rate of debt repayment in 
the 1972 fiscal year. According to 
a special financial report on the 
1970 season, the pool operation just 
about met this goal . (Since the 
pool season straddles two fiscal 
years, council requests a special 
pool report to assist it in setting 
fees.) 

Several changes in the rate 
structure for use of the pool were 
authorized by council, however, 
after last year's budget had been 
adopted. According to estimates 
by city manager James K. Giese, 
these resulted in a reduction of in­
come by about $650. These in­
cluded a small discount offered for 
purchase of passes prior to the 
opening of the pool season and two 
JTate reductions in season passes 
made retroactive to the start of 
the season-one for senior citizens 
and one for holders of single 
passes. 

Another change resulted In in­
creased wage costs for the pool. 
This was the council's decision at 
the beginning of the fiscal year to 
pay time and a half for overtime 
-hour . Although Recreation Di­
rector Darald Lofgren tried to aug­
ment the staff after the season had 
opened to reduce this additional 
cost, he wru; not able to bring the 
staff ;:o a size sufficient to elimi­
nate overtime payments altogether. 

Increase In Revenue 
Sales of season passes (in all 

categories except non - resident 
family passes) were greater in 1970 
than In the preceding year. Never­
theless, actual revenue was vir­
tually the same (down $7). Swim­
ming lessons, on the other hand, 
brought an increase of $237 over 
the 1969 season. Daily admissions 
also brought in increased revenue 
in 1970-about $440 more than in 
1969. Revenue from sales of group 
tickets for guests of pass holders 
brought in an additional $100 also 
over last year's sales. 

But along wilh incroases in reve­
nue was a parallel increase in ex­
penditures for the 1970 season. The 
major expense was salaries, which 
were about $3500 more than last 
year's. Other operating costs were 
down, however, making the overall 
expenditures for the 1970 season 
about $2000 more than for last 
year. Only the tdephone, utilities 
janitorial supplies, and pool chemi~ 
cals showed increases over the pre­
vious season's costs. Such Items as 
repairs, advertising, uniforms, and 
minor equipment showed small de­
creases. 

Concession Profit 
For the first time in several sea­

sons the refreshment stand conces­
sion made money. In previous 
years the concession has been a 
money loser. But in 1970 theree 
changes were Instituted in its 
method of operation: (1) lowering 
of the total volume of goods to be 
offered, (2) concentration on of­
fering only high-selling items. such 
as popcorn and ice cream bars. and 
(3) staying open only during peak 
hours. These changes lowered sig­
nificantly the salary costs for op­
erating the concession. Young 
adults, instead of a more highly 
paid senior manager, were able to 
supervise the reduced inventory. 

Thus, profits for the concession 
last summer were $236, ru; com­
pared with a deficit for the 1969 

by Al Skolnik 
It will cost users of the Green­

belt swimming pool more to swim 
this year. This was made certain by 
council last Monday night when it 
adopted a new schedule of rates for 
the 1971 season. The family season 
admission pass will rise 25 percent 
- from $28 to $35; that of a single 
person - from $14 to $17.50; and 
that of a senior citizen aged 62 and 
over - from $10 to $13. Similar 
increases will go into effect for 
non-Greenbelt residents; the fam­
ily pass from $60 to $75 and the 
single pass from $30 to $37.50. 

The daily admission rate for 
Greenbelt adults will increase at a 
more moderate rate - from 90c 
to $1. For non-Greenbelt residents, 
the daily admission rate would rise 
from $1.40 to $1.50 and the qhild 
daily admission - from 90c to $1. 

Some rates will not change, how­
ever. The daily admission rate for 
Greenbelt children and aged pers­
ons will remain at 50 cents. There 
will also be no change in the fees 
for swimming lessons. Campers 
froi:µ the Greenbelt Regional Park 
will continue to be allowed to swim 
after 5 p.m. at the non-residential 
daily admission rates. 

In justifying the increase, city 
manager Giese said that the pool 
operated at a break-even point 
last season. This meant that there 
was no profit available to be set 
asiae for the redemption of fu­
ture payments of bond principal 
and interest. According to the 
terms of the loan obtained to re­
construct the pool in 1966, the 
amount of principal to be paid back 
increases $5,000 a year starting next 
year. To date, the funds set side 
to absorb the shock of this change 
in debt repayment are minimal. 

Giese also expressed concern that 
the operation of the swimming pool 
has not yielded enough revenue to 
provide for future replacement of 
any swimming pool items. 

In addition, Giese noted that the 
city is faced with increasing ex­
penditures for operating the pool. 
Wage scales are regularly increas­
ed and the city is now paying 
time-and-a-half for overtime work. 
Swimming pool staff members cus­
tomarily work more than 40 hours 
a week. Utility service charges and 
pool chemical costs are increased 
periodically. Most recently, Giese 
said, the Washington Suburban 
Sanitary Commission has proposed 
a substantial increase in its water 
and sewer rates. 

The last major increase in pool 
rates was made in 1969. Giese ex­
pects that with the new increases 
sufficient funds will be generated 
to meet current operating expenses 
and debt service, and to provide a 

· small reserve for future debt serv­
ice payment or for equipment re­
placement. The pool is intended to 
be on a self-supporting basis. 

Giese said that although the 
increases are substantial, the 
Greenbelt swimming pool "should 
still be the best bargain in the 
area." As a comparison, he added, 
the City of Rockville charges its 
families $60 for a summer season 
plan at its outdoor swimming pool. 

BOOKS FOR VIET HOSPIT AtS 
The American Legion Post No. 

136 has designated March as 
"Books for Veteran Hospitals" 
month. Books may be brought to 
Co-op and Suburban Trust, North 
End, Center and Greenbelt Junior 
High Schools and the American 
Legion. Call Dick Pilski, 474-4581. 

season under a high-volume msm­
agement plan of $31 and a 1968 
deficit of $191. 

Thursday, March 11, 1971 

WHAT GOES ON 
Thurs., March 11, '7:45 p.m. GHI 

Board Meeting, Hamilton Pl. 
'7:45 p.m. Woman's Club Meet­
ing, Baptist Church 

Fri., March 12, 8:30 p.m. Dupli­
cate Bridge, Co-op Hospital­
ity Room 

Wed., March 1'7, 8 p.m. National 
Organization for Women, Co­
op Hospitality Room 
8 p.m. Greenbelt Homemaker's 
Club, 107 Lakeside 

Thurs., March 18, 8 p.m. PRAB 
SubCommittee on Pollution, 
Greenbelt Library 

Greenbelt Housing Census 
Greenbelt has 6,519 residential 

dwellings, housing a population of 
18,110, according to the 1970 De­
cennial Census. This comes out to 
2.8 persons per occupied unit, one 
of the lowest rates in Prince Geo­
orges county. The rate for the 
county as a whole was 3.3. 

This low occupancy per unit 
can be traced to the fact that 
Greenbelt has more than its share 
of apartment units and accordingly 
fewer rooms per unit than that of 
other areas. 

Of Greenbelt's 6519 units, 2,014 
are listed as owner-occupied (in­
cluding Greenbelt Homes, Inc.) and 
4,417 are renter occupied. Eighty­
eight were vacant at the time of 
the Census in April 1970. Only 
Langley Park and Laurel had such 
a high 2 to 1 proportion of renter­
occupied tinits. 

The median size of a Greenbelt 
unit was 4.6 rooms (that is, half 
the homes had more, half less). The 
cou t median was 5.2 rooms. The 
Langley Park and Laurel develop­
ments had medians of 4.0 and 4.5, 
respectively. 

The median rental charge for 
Greenbelt renter-occupied houses 
in April 1970 was $168 a month. 
(GHI houses are not included in 
this figure.) The only area in Prince 
Georges County to have a higher 
average was Bowie. The median 
for the county was $143. 

For the 668 owner-occupied 
homes in Greenbelt (excluding 
GHI), the median value in April 
1970 was $27,000. This was very 
close to the $27,700 median for the' 
metropolitan area, which includes 
Washington, D. C. and parts of 
Maryland and Virginia. The Prince 
Georges county average was $23,700 
and the Montgomery county aver­
age was $32,700. 

IN GREENBEL T'S LIBRARY 
The Great Decisions discussion 

programs will be held on March 
17, wJi.en the topic will be "Dissent, 
Public Opinion and Foreign Pol­
icy"; March 24, "West Germany"; 
March 31, "National Priorities and 
World Peace." These programs 
are at 7:30 p.m. in the Conference 
Room. 

Young adults will hold two spe­
cial meetings. On Wednesday, 
March 17, the topic will be "Pro­
gressive Survival," and on March 
24 the topic will be "Tomorrow's 
Tomorrow?" Both are at 7:30 p.m. 
in the Meeting Room. 

The children's WEB's book dis­
cussion group for ages 10-12 will 
meet Wednesdays at 7 p.m. in the 
Children's Program Room on March 
17, 24 and 31. 

Woman's Club News 
The Woman's Club of Greenbelt 

monthly membership meeting will 
be held on Thursday, March 11, at 
7:io p.m. in the Meeting Room, 
lower level, Baptist Church on 
Crescent Road. 

A musical progra.m will be fea­
tured by the Fine Arts Committee. 
Friends and guests are invited. 

COUNCIL TO PROBE SERIOUSLY 
ACQUISITION OF PARCELS 1, 2, 15 

by AI Skolnik 
City council will hold a special committee of the whole meeting 

on Monday, March 15, to explore various aspects of the question 
of whether the city should purchase parcels 1, 2, and 15. This de­
cision was made by council at its regular meeting on Monday, 
March 8, after receiving a preliminary report from city manager 
James K. Giese on the subject. 

Parcels 1 and 2 are the undevel­
oped tracts between the Baltimore­
Washington Parkway and Green­
belt Homes, Inc. property. Par­
cel 15 is the undeveloped land 
south of Greenbelt Lake adjacent 
to the Capital Beltway. 

Giese "guesstimated" that the 
three pieces of property (exclud­
ing the 72 acres now owned by the 
school board) would cost $1.8 mil­
lian, but cautioned that this esti­
mate could be substantially off i! 
only slight changes were made in 
the per acre valuations he used. 
The figure might be reduced to $1 
million if Federal and State open­
ispace grants were forthcoming. 

Assuming that the $1 million 
purchase could be financed through 
a 25-year bond issue, Giese esti­
mated that the annual debt service 
would be somewhere around $75,000 

Co-op Nurs. School 
Registrat:ionMar 29 

The Greenbelt Nursery School 
will hold its annual Registration 
Night on Monday, March 29, from 
8 to 10 pm at the school (in the 
Fellowship Hall behind the Com­
munity Ch,urch, Hillside and Cres­
cent Roads.) 

All parents, including alumni 
parents who have not yet regis­
tered, who may wish to enroll a 
child in the nursery school for the 
1971-72 year, should plan to attend. 
The teachers and a committee of 
members will be present to talk 
to parents. 

The school, which is now in its 
30th year, is a non-profit coopera­
tive, !ully approved by the state 
of Maryland. As a cooperative, it 
relies on each parent-member's par­
ticipation as a clru;sroom aide to 
the teacher on a rotating schedule. 

Two morning classes and one af­
ternoon class will be held daily. 
Applicants will be notified of ac­
ceptance. 

NEW BUS SERVICE 
A new bus service between the 

National Security Agency at Ft. 
Meade and Greenbelt was started 
on March 1 by the WMA Transit 
Co. The bus makes three stops in 
Washington, D.C. and then enters 
Greenbelt via Southway Road at 
7:05 a.m. It travels along Ridge 
Road and exits from Greenbelt on 
Research Road, The principal stops 
on Ridge Road are Southway, East­
way, and Plateau Place but it will 
stop anywhere along that route if 
flagged down. The bus arrives at 
NSA, Gate 3, at 7:35 a.m. It de­
parts in the evening from Gate 3 
e.t 4:30 p.m. and travels the same 
route in reverse. Further infor­
mation may be obtained by call­
ing 688-7101. 

PRAB MEETS THURSDAY 
The PRAB subcommittee on PQ· 

llution ordinances meets Thurs., 
March 18, at 8 pm, in the Green­
belt Library conference room. On 
the agenda are the proposed out­
door burning ordinance and noise 
control ordinances. The public is 
welcome. 

WSSC Public Hearing 
The Washington Suburban Sani­

tary Commission has invited pub­
lic review of their proposed budget 
on Monday, March 15, at 8 p.m. in 
the Commission's Office Building 
Auditorium, 4017 Hamilton Street, 
Hyattsville. 

The rates for water service will 
be increased 23% from 30 cents to 
37 cents per thousand gallons. The 
sewer usage charge will be in­
creased 17% from 23½ cents to 27 1{, 

cents per thousand gallons of 
metered water. 

a year. This would amount to an 
increru;e of approximately 15 cents 
in the city tax rate, based on the 
city's curi;ent assessed valuation. 
However, the development of the 
Greenbriar and Glenora apartment 
projects in the next few years could 
raise the city's assessed valuation 
considerably and lower the tax 
rate accordingly. 

Giese said that there are many 
factors to be considered in the land 
purchase. One is the question of 
who should do the purchasing. 
Since some of the savings in not 
having to provide public facilities 
for parcels 1 and 2 would accrue 
to county or other non-city agen­
cies, it may be questioned wheth­
er the city should foot the entire 
bill for the purchase. The . city has 
already asked the Maryland-Na­
tional Capital Park and Planning 
Commission, the Washington Sub­
urban Sanitary Commission, and 
the school board to study the fu­
ture development and prospects for 
these parcels. In response, the 
MNCPPC has suggested that a task 
force be set up with city participa­
tion. 

Another factor to consider, Giese 
said, is other capital expenditure 
needs of the city. He mentioned 
proposals for development of newly 
acquired park land, an indoor 
swimming pool, need for increased 
city office space, and road recon­
struction work. 

Any decision to purchase the 
three tracts would be subject to 
approval by the voters at a refer­
endum. In the meantime, the city 
has had indications that the zon­
ing hearing scheduled for March 19 
for parcels 1 and 2 may be post­
poned. 

Council VMa.ncy 

The next regular meeting of 
council will be held on Monday, 
March 22, at which time Mayor 
Edgar Smith expects council wm 
make a choice of a new council 
member to fill the vacancy created 
by Francis White's resignation. He 
said last Monday night that coun­
cil has not completed its evalua­
tion of the resumes it has received 
to date. A vote of at least three 
members of council is required to 
make the appointment. 

College Park Annexation 

The council went on record once 
again in opposing-the College Park 
annexation plan and will present 
testimony in opposition at the publi~ 
hearing, Tuesday, March 16, at the 
College Park city hall. College 
Park proposes to annex nearly all 
of the Agricultural Research Cen­
ter between the B-W Parkway 
and the Baltimore & Ohio Railroad, 
except for a strip of land running 
along the northern city limits and 
lying east of Indian Creek, Beaver 
Dam Road, and in the vicinity of 
Powder Mill Road. The city of 
Greenbelt generally opposes any 
annexation relating to Research 
Center land east of the B&O rail­
road. 

10-Y ear Sewer Plan 

Council member Elizabeth Maf­
fay, in reporting on last week's 
public hearing on the 10-year \Vat­
er and Sewers Program, said that 
the city's recommendation that the 
entire Smith-Ewing tract be allo­
cated to category #3 - an im­
mediate needs category, instead of 
category #4, which calls for sew­
ering within the next ten years, 
\\'BS subjected to criticism by those 
who opposed any further housing 
development at this time. She won­
dered If the city should review its 
position. 

Giese explained that the city's 
recommendation was based on the 
fact that the area to be served 
by the Briar Ditch drainage sys­
tem (Branch "A") - which is a. 
natural drainage area - has al­
ready been approved for category 
#3. This area includes the Smith• 
Ewing tract south of Greenbelt 
Road which will house the Glenora 

See COUNCIL, page 4, col. 1 
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Parking Problems 
To the Editor: 

An a nonymous person sent me a 
copy of Mr. Charles McDonald's 
r ecent lette r to the News Review 
in which he stated that he "was 
disappointed to learn that GHI had 
turned down a plan for more park­
ing at 18 Ridge Road and shelved 
another request at 5 Southway 
Road." (sic) 

I did vote against the 18 Ridge 
reques t, not because I am unsym­
pathetic to their needs nor because 
I do not recognize that w e indeed 
have a parking problem, but be­
cause I believe t hat our budget has 
been curtailed too much to spend 
unanticipated sum s on additional 
pa rking space, howevn much 
needed. 1 don't know any real way 
to economize except to quit spcnd­
ino- money, to the extent possiblp 

As fo r 4 Southway, that is a dif­
ferent proposition. Mr. James 
Smith has requested t hat a drive­
way be cut through from South­
way so he can park a car in his 
garden adjacent to the road. Up to 
now neither t he City nor GH I has 
been willing to accede to this re­
quest. 

W e a re well awa re t hat there is 
a Sou thway parking p roblem , but 
a llowing residen ts of e nd houses to 
put d riveways in to the street will 
r educe t he total n umber of pa rking 
spaces available. The w idth of a 
driveway plus the space on either 
side in wh ich parking is not allow­
ed w ill m ore tha n offset the park­
ing r elief obtained by pu tting some 
cars in gardens. 

One solution, if th e residents of 
2 and 4 Courts on Southway were 
willing, would be to take a rather 
large section of their gardens to 
make a parking alley. If I lived in 
one of those courts, I would not 
want this, but I do not know their 
views. 

Assuming that t hey would want 
to lose twelve feet of their gardens 
and look at parked cars of course 
they could plant screening shrubs 

unless they all agreed to pay th e 
cost of such an alley themselves 
there would be a financing problem 
fo r GHI. 

If w e can not a fford a slight en­
largement of an already exis ting 
parkng lot and a replanting of a 
few shrubs, we certainly r annot at 
this t' c consi 'e t wo n<'w parking 
'-'ourts. 

I th< rine lfo<'nf" 

City Notes 
T h n cit y's Public ·w orks Dept. 

has been t rying differ ent solutions 
for pers istent drainage problems in 
Boxwood Village. Because of -; 
sandy soil, steep slopes, a nd n um­
erous s prings in tha t section of t h e 
city, er osion a nd undermining of 
s idewalks has occurred from time 
to time. In one section of sidewalk 
on P eriwinkle Ct. the crew re­
moved the paving to repair an 
e roded area . A temporary patch 
of aspha lt was then put down, 
which will be removed later when 
a contractor is hired to do concr ete 
work. 

On Last ner Lane a diffe rent 
m ethod was tried to repair an 
undermined section. A s izable 
quantity of wet cem en t was pump ­
ed into the hole beneath t h e side­
walk in the h ope that when it 
hardened it would stabilize the soil 
and prevent fur ther erosion . 

Early Thursday morning, March 
4, t h e city crew was out, salting 
and sanding streets in the wake 
of a freezing rain and light snow 
that made streets dangerously 
slippery. 

During the 
weather the 
worked inside 
ice B uilding, 
tables. 

r ecent bout of bad 
general crew has 
the Municipal Serv­
constructing picnic 
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Thanks For Your Help 
To the Editor: 

The sixth grade students of 
Greenbelt Center School would like 
to thank all those people who came 
to our bake sale and car wash. 

We would also like to thank .all 
those who donated puzzles, bottles, 
doll clothes, newspapers, baked 
goods and supplies for the car 
wash. 

We appreciate all the efforts of 
the parents and teachers and the 
people who allowed us to have the 
bake sale in front of their build­
ings. 

It wa s a huge success a nd w e 
reach ed our m oney goal. 

The Sixth Graders 

Thanks 
To the Editor : 

We wish to thank the Greenbelt 
Rescue Squad for the speed with 
which they responded and the com­
passion they showed when our 
daugh ter Ariela was suddenly 
t a k en ill. 

Rabbi an<l Mrs. :u. \Vc·is!'nb!'rg 

Fi lms Stressing 
Survival To Be Shown 

Young Adults, junior and senior 
high school age, a re cordially in­
vited to the Greenbelt Libra ry m eet­
ing room on two W ednesda y even­
ings, Mar ch 17 and 24, to see and 
talk about four provocative short 
films focusing on the general topic 
of Survival, individual and com­
m unity. The films a re: Hypothese 
Beta; Boomsville: Acceleration 
Hom o Homini; Genius Man. These 
films have been used as a spring­
board for free discussion and idea 
exchange in various groups; in an­
imation and color they pinpoint 
some of the hopes and apprehen­
s ions of modern man, particularly 
of youth. 

JUDAISM COURSE 
A course in Basic Judaism is 

being given a t the Mishkan Torah 
Synagogue, Ridge and W estway 
R oads, from 11:15 a .m . to 12:15 
every Sunday. Anyone is welcome 
to attend any srnglc session, con­
ducted b ;• Rabb; Maurice \ Veisen­
berg, without having attc n Jed any 
other. 

'lfflllr 
U l Centerwa;\' l\rt,s 47-l-5700 I 

Open House 
Sunday, March 14 

2 PM - 5 PM 
OLDER COLONIAL HOME * 
4 BEDROOMS, 2 BATHS. 
WASHER, DRYER, AIR CON­
DITIONER INCLUDED. 
HOME rs IN A VERY NICE 
AREA - CLOSE TO SCHOOLS 
AND TRANSPORTATION. 
REASONABLY PRICED AT 
$23,500. MAY BE FHA OR 
VA FINANCE D. 4305 QUEENS­
BURY R D., HYATTSVILLE 
OFF RT. # l 
Call, if you wish to see th e 
house soon er . 
WE HA VE PURCHASERS W H O 
WANT TO BUY YOUR H OME! 
WE CAN SELL YOUR HOME 
AND ALL OR PART OF YOUR 
PROCEEDS MAY BE USED 
TO BUY A LARGER HOME IN 
ANY AREA YOU DESIRE. 
Call us now for one of our ex­
perienced salesmen to a dvise you 
on listing your home and selling 
you a home of your choice. 

GREENBELT SHOPPING 
CENTER 

Next to Mobil Gas Station 

Thursday. March 11, 197 1 

St. Hugh's School 
Science Fair Winners 

Six grand prize winners sent to 
the Regional Fair are: Neil Don­
nelly - Holograms; Carol Fowler -
Mouthwash effectiveness; Mike Mor­
iarty - Pollution and plants; Me­
linda Potts - Effects of weather 
on pollution ; Te rese Tous ignant -
Temperature on the souring of 
milk; Berna dette White - optical 
illusions. 

'1ubject Area winners: Botany : 
1. Mike Moriarty, Paul Geiger; Hon­
orable Mention: 1. Sue Levesque, 
2. Joe Yakupkovic ; Chemistry: 1. 
Terese Tousignant, 2. Kathy Mc­
Evoy; Environmental and Space 
Sciences ; l. Melinda Potts, 2. Mat­
thew Weber, 3. Lisa Staab; Behav­
ioral Sciences: 1. Susan Ke!ller, 2. 
T ow Downs, 3. Ruth Baluch; Medi­
cal Sciences: 1. Carol Fowler; Hon­
ora ble Mention: 1. Mike Bates, 2. 
Charles Havekost, 3. Mary Keller; 
Physics : 1. N eil Donnelly, 2. Ber­
nadette W h ite, 3. Bill Brown; H on ­
orable Mention: 1. Tim O'Keefe 
2. David Stratchke ; Zoology - H on 
orable Mention: 1. Rick Green, 
Ralph Thornson ; Engineering -
Honora ble Mention : Harry Noel. 

HOllEMAKER'S ( L B 
The regular monthly meeting of 

the Greenbelt Homemaker's Club 
will be held at the home of Mrs. 
E. Karlander, 107 Lakeside Drive 
in Greenbelt on March 17 at 8 p.m. 
T he club members who atten ded 
t he r ecent 'Creative Cookery' pro­
g ra m a t the Greenbelt Library will 
give a report and p repa re some of 
the unusual things m entioned. The 
'Creative Cookery' program was 
put on by the Home Demonstration 
Agents from the Prince Georges 
County Office. 

The various homemakers groups 
in the county are affiliated with the 
Extension Department at the Uni­
vers ity of Maryland. Any woman 
in the a r ea is w elcom e to join w ith 
the group at a ny time. 

~ 
McKee Realty, Inc. 

S.-abrook Shopping Center 

459-5400 

FIRST OFFERING 
THREE BEDROOM BRICK 

' TO\VNHOUSE CLOSE TO 

GREENBE LT SHOPP ING 

CE N TI<JR 

Vi all t0 wa I e rpc-ti11 , wa~! er, 
dryer window air .;-onditioners, 
are " me of th<' extras included 
in this attractive home. Hurry 

1 
on this one! 

'•IlEEXBELT - Attractive 4 
bedrooms, 2' ,, bath, split foyer. 
·wall-to-wall carpeting t h rough­
out. Central ai r condit ioning and 
many more extras. Level lot with 
plenty of trees. Call immediate­
ly on this beauty. 

"PRODUCT KNOWLEDGE IS 
OUR STRENGTH" 

Holy 
Cross 
Lutheran 
Church 
690.5 Greenbelt Rd. 

Wor ship Services 

8 :30 a nd 11 :15 A.:u. 
Sunday School 9 :30 A.M.. 

E dward H. Birner , Pastor 

Phone 315-5111 

--·------------------
GREENBELT NURSERY SCHOOL, INC. 
A Non-Profi t Coope rative - N ow in its 30th Year 

(Accredited by the State of Maryland) 
Ages 3 to 5 - Professional Teaching Staff 

ANNOUNCEMENT 
REGISTRATION FOR NURSERY SCHOOL 

Registration for the 1971-72 school year will be held on Monday, 
March 29, from 8 to 10 p.m. at the school (in Fellowsh ip Hall behind 
the Community Church, Crescent and Hillside Rds., Greenb~lt ). :rhe 
Director and teachers of the School will be present to meet interested 
parents and to answer questions. A committee of members will also 
be 'Jn ha nd to help fill out the regis tra tion forms and to s how parents 
the school classrooms. 

Two morning classes and one afternoon class will be held; total 
enrollment is limited to 48. Applicants will be notified of a cceptance. 
An application fee of $5.00 (no refund ) must accompany application 
form. The present tuition (1970-71) is $29.00 per month ; the tuition 
fo r 1971-72 will be determined at the first m embership meeting in 
Sept. The school is non-profit. 

N OTICE TO ALUMNI PARENTS who may be planning to enroll 
a child for next year: Despite rapid population growth in the area , 
we will try to continue to give first consideration to old m embers. 
P lea se plan to reg ister now. Alumni who are still undecided but want 
places held for their children are urged to notify the m embership 
committee. 
FOR TELEPHONE INFORMATION CALL: 

Mrs. Ryan - 422-8829 Mrs. Berkman - 345-8549 
M rs. Savage - 474-4904 

Attention GHI Senior Citizens Attention 

GHJ F iscal Office has the forms for the 1971 Senior Citizen T aK 

Cr ed it. T he County h as r equest ed tha t these forms be filed by Apr il 

1, 1971. T o new sen ior citizens of GHI t he requ irements set forth by 

the County to obtain Real Estate Tax Relief are as fol!,')WS: 

<1) reside in the dwelling 

(2) h ave ownership in the property 

(3) be 65 year s of age by July 1, 1971 

( 4) tota l gross income of a ll t he p ropert y owners shall 

not exceed $5,000 fo r 1970. ( not including Socia l 

Security ) 

Please call 474-6601 if you ha ve a ny questions . To our senior citi­

zens who have filed previously, let us know when you are coming, in 

1 order that we can have the informa tion s upplied by GHI available. 

I 

!!A' •• • • • • 

lir1 I 

ON!! 
Residents of 

GR EENBELT PLAZA APARTMENTS 
SPRINGHILL LAKE APARTMENTS 
L AKESIDE NORTH AP AR TMENTS 
CHARLESTOWNE VIL LAGE 
BOXW OOD VILLAGE 
GREE N BELT PLAZA APART MENTS 
G. D. C. AP ARTMENTS 
CRESCENT ROAD APARTMENTS 
P ARKWAY ROAD APARTMENTS 
L AKESCREST HOMES 
LAKESI DE HOMES 
LAKEWOOD HOMES 
WOODLAND HILLS HOMES 
G. H . L H OMES 
UNIVERSITY SQUARE APARTMENTS 

You are a resident of the CITY OF GREENBELT. Please 
be sure you report this on your state INCOME TAX and 
AUTO LICENSE application forms so that a portion of 
YOUR TAXES will be RETURNED TO THE CITY for local 
improvements. 

City of Greenbelt 

U NITED METHODIST CHURCH 
C\lowatt Memorial) 40 Ridge R oad, Greenbelt, :\l<I. 

Telephone 474--9•UO 
Rev. Clifton Cunnin~ham, Pastor - Tel 474-3381 

Worship Service 11 :00 A.M. 
(Nursery through 2nd ~-r11de at 11 :om 

Church School (3rd grade through adults) 9:30 A.M. 

9 :45 A.M. Sunday School 6:00 P .M. Training Union 

11 :00 A.M . ... Morning Worship 7 :00 P .1\1. Even ing Worship 

7:30 P .l\[. Wednesday ... ............. ·-····-···· ,n.tweek Service 

GREENBELT BAPTIST CHURCH 
Cres<'ent & Greenhill Rds. S. Jasper Morris, Jr., Pastor 47-1-40-10 

Greenbelt Community Church 
(United Chur ch of Christ) 

Hillside a nd Crescent Roads 

Family \Vorship 11 a .m. 

Churc-h !--c-hool P rogr-am 11 a.m. 
(:Nurser~· Care Provided) 

Coffee lfour 12 1' 0011 

Churc-h Telephone - -17-1-6171 (:\Jornings) 

P astor Robert L. Field 
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C L A S S I F I E D IJeui 
$1.00 for a 10-word minimum, 15c 
tor each additional word. Submit 
ads in writing, accompanied by 
cash payment. either to the News 
Review officE: at '1.5 Parkway before 
10 p.m. of the .ruesday preceding 
publication, or to the Twin Pines 
Savings and Loan office. 
There is no charge for advertising 
Items that are found. 

CALDWELL'S WASHER SER­
VICE. All makes expertly repaired. 
Authorized Whirlpool dealer. GR 
•-6515. 103 Centerway. 

PI~NO TUNING AND REPAIR. 
EXPERIENCED. RELIABLE. 
474-6894. 

LEARN TO DRIVE - beat high 
cost of Driver Education - CALL 
TRI-STATE DRIVING SCHOOL -
off. 347-7773, res. 420-9016. 

TYPEWRITER REPAIR, ELEC­
TRIC, STANDARD AND PORTA­
Bt..ES. Call 474-6018. 

PIANOS: - Discount prices on fin­
er quality new Spinets & consoles. 
Save over $200. Ten-year warran­
ty. 474-6894. 

PIANO INSTRUCTION - Peabody 
Conservatory graduate - will ac­
cept students. Beginners, Inter­
mediates & advanced at his studio 
- 474-6894. 

PORTER'S LIQUORS 
(Next to McDonald's) 

8200 Bnlto. Blvd. 474-8278 

Complete Line of Bfoveragea 

We specialize in wines 

from around the world. 

FOR TV and STEREO SERV­
ICE CALL HENRY ALBRIGHT 
935-5447. 

Hoffman Cleaners and Laundry 
Pick-up Service - 345-6239. 

PAINTING-Interior and Exterior. 
Greenbelt area. Call Dick Stew­
art 345-7682. 

"MARIE'S POODLE GROOMING", 
make your appointment today. 474. 
3219. 

-------------· 
ANTENNA 
PROBLEMS 

Expert antenna man wlII 
Install new/repair anten­
na In my spare time and 
Sundays. 

474-7229 

Interested in a Greenbelt Co-opera­
tive Nursery School experience for 
your child ancl yourself? Come to 
R egistration Night Monday, March 
29 at 8 p.m. (See a d on page 2). 

DRTVER RIDER WANTED: Vi­
cinity ,th & Independence Ave., 
S.W. Hours· 8 to 4:30. Ca ll 474-
4561 after 6 p.m. 

ALTE:lcAT,ONS by experienceo 
seamstre;.;~. Can pick-up and de­
lh·er fin iill:e,l work. Call anytime 
315-9136. 

TYPIST: - Dictaphone experience 
necessary. Insurance claims exper­
ience preferred. Hospitalization 
and paid vacation, salary open. 
Metropolitan Claim Service, 111 
Centerway, Greenbelt, Md. PHONE: 
474-2130. 

FOR SALE: - 21" Motorola B/W 
TV, cabinet by Drexel. Best offer. 
345-9091. 

3-Bedroom Frame facing woods, 
secluded location, remodeled kit­
chen, bath; wai:;her, dryer, fenced­
yards, patio. 345-6899. 

Elaine Skolnik - 474-6060 
Congratulations to Mrs. Adele 

Jpnkins, 109 White Birch, who re­
ceived an Outstanding Service 
Award from the Prince Georges 
County Federation of Parks and 
Recreation Councils. Mrs. Jen­
kins was recognized for being an 
instrmncntal member in forming 
the Girls' Club in Greenbelt, an or­
ganization that has gl'Own to over 
200 girls. She has also established 
the cheer leader program in Green­
belt. 

After a 3-year tour of duty with 
the United States Green Berets, 
Joe Seay, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Randolph Seay, 6-S Plateau, is 
home. He is attending Prince 
Georges Community College and is 
employed by Computer Soft Ware. 

SHL's Campfire Girls are 
making hand puppets for Child­
ren's Hospital. 

SHL Junior Troop 2270 visited 
the Hyattsville Nursing Home as a 
service project. 

February's Boy Scout Court of 
Honor at SHL saw Ricky Thomas 
join the ranks as a Tenderfoot. 
Allen Merzer advanced to Second 
Class, Ron Lavallee to First Class 
and Hal Deiter to Star. 

The following SHL Cub Scouts 
were winners in the car contest: 
eight-year-olds, Lawrence Patter­
son, first, Andrew Ott, second, 
Arnold Bocketaitis, third, most un­
usual, Mark Crabtree, craftsman­
ship, Mike Northcutt, most origi­
nal. 'Troy Black; nine-year-olds, 
Hank Kasindorf, first, Brian Ger­
stel, second, Jim Buckley, third. 
most unusual, Brian Gerstel, 
craftsmanship, John Mouchti, most 
original, Lloyd Turner:; ten-ycar­
olds. Mike Allsbrook, first, Gary 
Seibel, second, Victor Aberman, 
third, Bruce Byer, most unusual, 
Steven Newton, craftsmanship, 
Jimmy De!Medico most original. 

Parkdale High School student 
Howard M. Finkelstein of Green­
belt was among the four young 
Marylanders selected for participa­
tion in "A Presidential classroom 
for Young Americans." Last week 
the group met with Senators 
Charles McC. Mathias, Jr. and J . 
Glenn Beall, Jr. 

TWO CUTE TINY TOY POODLE 
PUPS - A.K.C. registered - REA­
SONABLE. Call 474-3219. 

RIDE WANTED: - To 18th & K 
N.W. Hrs. 9-5:30. Possible negoti­
ation of hrs. to fit yours. 345-6197 
after 7:30, 223-1975. days. 

RIDE WANTED from New Car­
rollton to vicinty of 19th & M 
N.W. - 8:45-5:30. 577-5304. 
'67 GTO, 4-spd., excellent condition. 
Interested buyers only, $1250. 345-
2141. 

BABYSITTI!:R - 6 evenings (Mon­
days and Thursdays) in April 6:45-
10. Call 345-3789. 

DRESSBAKING - ALTERATIONS: 
F ormal & Informal Bridal, Proms, 
Everyday W ear. 474-6447. 

ROOl'vI TORE NT - $50. Prefer 
f Pmale. 345-6679. 
CHILD CARF.:---\Vould like to 
care for infant. 15 years' experi­
ence, reference. 577-1505. 

W ANT E D: - Air condit ioner wh ich 
will fit through a 15" by 10 1

0 " win­
dow, 110 volts. 474-3635. 
SALE BY OWNER: - 3 bedroom 
masonry encl close to Center 
modern kitchen, air-conditioned: 
large yard. 474-0425. 

GIVE AWAY: - 2 Siamese cats, 
male & female. Rupp Chopper min­
ibike, almost new $100, cost $140. 
345-9459. 

EARLY AMERICAN FURNITURE 
FOR SALE: bdr'm, Iv. rm. , book­
case, TV, stereo, sm. elec. applian­
ces, Tonka Toys, games, "I can 
read" and "Golden" children's books. 
Phone: 572-4430. 
WANTED: - Cage and 2 gerbils. 
Reasonable. 474-4906. 

Kirk's Tax Service 
(Since 1968) 

:Featurt-s: 

• Personal interview, taxes computed while you watch 

• Interview this week, ready to mail next ~londay 

• \Vork guaranteed 

Call 345-9589 for information or advice after 5:00 - call NOW 
for appointment - none scheduled after April 8. 

GREENBELT NEWS REVIEW 

Recreation Cont ere nee 
"New Frontiers in Recreation" is 

the theme of the fifth annual Rec­
reation Council Conference. It will 
be held on Saturday, March 13, at 
the Bowie Community Center at 
Route 450 and Stoney Brook Drive 
in Bowie, Mel. 

After registration at 8:30 a.m., 
four workshops will begin at 9 a.m. 
on Parks and Ecology, Cultural Ac­
tivities, School Use-Board of Ed­
ucation, and Recreation Councils. 
A general session on recreation 
problems is planned for the af­
ternoon to bring together all the 
participants. The public is invited 
to take part in the day's programs. 

Luncheon res'ervations must be 
made in advance by March 5. For 
details call the Department of 
Parks and Recreation, 277-2200. 

MD. U. SPRING CONCERT 
The University of Maryland Sym­

phony Band will present its annual 
spring· concert on Friday, March 
12, at 8:15 p.m. in Tawes Fine 
Arts Theater on the College Park 
campus. 

The 68-member Symphony Band, 
composed of outstanding wind and 
percussion performers on campus, 
is the premier concert performing 
organization of the University band 
program. The concert is free and 
,,pen to the public. 

Meeting on Drug Abuse 
A meeting on drug abuse in 

Greenbelt, sponsored by Youth For 
Better Living, will be held at the 
Greenbelt Library on March 22 at 
9 p.m. Dr. A. V. Pinkney, Narcotics 
Education, will be the speaker. A 
film titled "A Crutch For All Sea­
sons" will be shown. Come and 
bring a friend. There is no charge. 

MUSIC FESTIVAL 
The 14th Annual Instrumental 

Music Festival of the Prince 
Georges County Schools will be 
held at Northwestern Senior High 
School on Saturday, March 13 b -
ginning at 8:30 a.m. 

Students will perform as soloists 
or in ensembles, bands, or orches­
tras and will be rated by adjudica­
tors on their musical perform­
ances. Bands and orchestras from 
at least fourteen senior high 
schools will perform in the audi­
torium and more than 350 soloists 
and ensembles from both junior 
and senior high schools will per­
form in various designated rooms 
at Northwestern. The soloists and 
ensembles will begin their per­
formances at 8:30 a.m.; the bands 
and orchestras will begin their 
performances at 8:30 a.m.; the 
bands and orchestras will begin at 
9 a .m. 

T he public is invited to attend. 
Admission is free. 

TYPE ITE S 
Sales Rentals Repairs 

SCM Dealer 

Howard's Typewriter Co. 
277-8333 773-0913 

Scouts Have Tree 
Planting Project 

Prince Georges District Boy 
Scouts will be taking to the fields 
and streams on March 20, 1971 to 
begin a massive tree planting op­
eration that will eventually plant , 
100,000 trees in Prince Georges 
County by the end of 1971. 

Phase one of the operation will 
be 60,000 seedlings to be used for 
reforestation, beatification and 
game food pl'Oducers. Most of the 
seedlings will be planted on public 
property in all areas of the Couun­
ty. These properties include lands 
under the jurisdiction of Maryland­
National Capital Park and Plan­
ning Commission, Department of 
Public Works, Board of Education, 
Army Corps of Engineers and oth­
er similar agencies. 

CARPENTER WORK 

Free Estimates 

Rec. Rooms, Bars, Pon:hea, 

Cabineta, Room Additions, etc. 

Call 845-7461 or 34o-8'70S 

HAIR DRESSER 
Exp. Stylist & Self-starter with 

PZAZ 

& 
follo11 ing welcome 

Ph. 474-4881 
Greenbelt Beauty Salon 

... ,. .... 
A .. ...... .. 

State Farm 
Insurance 

Ron 
Borgwardt 

474-8400 
Auto - Life • Homeownen 

10210 Baltimore Blvd. 
College Park, Md. Z0'7t0 

(on U. S. 1 at the Beltway) 

ELECTROLUX 
Need ladies & gentlemen 

to represent us in this 

area. 

Please Call 

762-2151 

Remodeling? 

Complete Kitchens 

& Bathrooms 

BOB PETRLIK 459-0935 

SAVE AUTOMATICALLY 
We pay the fee when you have money sent direct 
to us from your pay check. 

Also, we do not charge for making automatic 
Greenbelt Homes payments or Twin Pines loan 
payments from your savings account. 

And the current dividend rate on savings accounts 

is 5½%. 

Twin Pines Savings and Loan 
474-6900 

9 A.!U. - 8 P.l\L Weekdays 9 A.l\L - 2 P .".U. Saturday 
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KASH Realtor 
MOMES FOR SALE 

Call 845-2151 Anytime 
Four fine offices to serve yotL 

MULTIPLE LISTING 
SERVICE 

FIGHT! over this 3 BR Kash 
rent beater for $101.25/mo. after 
clwn. pmt. This includes all util­
ities except elect. and phone. 
This beautiful paneled home has 
remodeled kit. with dishwasher, 
washer, lgt. ref., A/C plus other 
features. Only $13,000. 

DONT' LOSE, FOR FIRST 
CLASS PROFESSIONAL SER­
VICE LIST YOUR HOME WITH 
KASH, YOUR LOCAL REAL­
TOR. CALL 345-2151 ANYTIME, 
BEFORE YOU GO TO WORK 
OR AFTER OUR REGULAR 9 
to 9 OFFICE HOU_R_S_. __ _ 

IN THIS CORNER we have a 
$3,000 <lown pmt. plus settlement 
and take over pmts. on this 2 
BR Brick home with rec. rm. in 
the basement. Located near shop­
ping and ready to go. $23,750. 

DON'T F'EINT over tbis beau­
tiful 2 BR home with only 
$90.50/mo. With remodeled kit., 
W /W carpet, Washer, redecor­
ated throughout and next to 
woods. $11,600. 

CLINCH this beautiful -l BR 2% 
Bath C/ A home with wall oven, 
clisp., dishwasher, VV / W carpet­
ing, rec. room on jl. !gt. lot. Don't 
let this one go by at $33,500 on 
FHA/ VA t erms or take over 
pmts of $205 Imo. after dwn. 
pmt. $33,500 ! 

QUEENSBURY RULES this is 
the most beautiful 3 BR home 
with a Brick Williamsburg ad­
dition and F.P. Also, remodeled 
kit. in a prime location. Imagine 
gazing over your own room 22 
feet in length with random 
length boards in authentic style. 
Call for details. 

NO SECOND chance with this 
fine 2 BR (with opt. 3rd), 2 
bath home with W /W carp. lge. 
rec. rm with bar and T/S kit. 
Take over pmts. of $152/roo. af­
ter dwn. pmt. or buy on !<'HA/ 
VA terms, $125,550. 

SPAR not a moment if you 
want to get this beautiful 3 BR 
Brick home with beautiful pan­
eled !iv. rm. & din. rm. Fine 
remodeled kit. and bath, plus 
beautiful shaded lawn near the 
new library. Take over pmts. of 
$131/ mo. after clwn. pmt. $26,850. 

LEFT JAB right to the apart­
ment rent when you move into 
this pleasant 2 BR home near 
the Greenbelt Shopping Center 
and take over pmts. of $84.25/mo. 
after dwn. pmt. Recently paint­
ed and comes with Washer and 
dryer. Buy now and save. $10,500. 

UPPER CUT! W ould you be­
lieve your new h ome could be 
this uncrowded in this spacious 
3 BR rancher with added fam­
ily rec. r oom. AL;o this home is 
Cent. A C an<l all appliances 
including a F /F ref. This home 
is outstanding and will not last 
long! $33,000. 
RIGHT (ROSS t he road a re 
other fine homes of equa l valuP, 
but t h ey are not for sale. Buy 
this fabulous 4 BR 2 bath, C/ A 
brick home on lge lot. Offered 
on all terms, this is a steal at 
$30,500. 
DON'T BE A "FRAZIER" to 
get out of the $2,000/ yr. you are 
putting into an apt. Buy this 
2 BR home with basement with 
modest dwn. pmt. and take over 
pmts. of $148/mo. Remodeled kit. 
and nice lawn. $22,700 

BLOW will be struck over 
this 3 BR home next to woods. 
Now is your opportunity to take 
over pmts~ of $101.25/mo. after 
dwn. pmt. $14,700. 

SLUG it out with the rent cycle 
and you will see you cannot beat 
this 2 BR home near the Green­
belt Shopping Center. Take over 
pmts. of $88/mo. after dwn pmt. 
and you will get a beautiful home 
with dishwasher, washer, new 
dryer, plus many other features, 
Get this showplace for $11,550. 

KASH Rea1tor 
(Above Post Office) 

345-2151 
·-------------·-
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COUNCIL from page 1 
apartments, and part of the Smith­
Bwing tract north of Greenbelt 
Road, which will house the new 
Greenbelt senior high school and 
part of the Greenbriar apartments. 
The city's position is that the new 
sub-trunk line programmed for im­
mediate construction to serve this 
area should be built of sufficient 
capacity to serve the remainder 
of the Smith-Ewing tract north of 
Greenbelt Road. (This connection 
through the use of a lift, or pump­
ing station). 

Subsequent to the meeting, Giese 
told a News Review reporter that 
the city is assuming that no sewer 
connections will be made until the 
Blue Plains plant can adequately 
handle the capacity and that the 
city's action was not intended as 
advocating t he lifting of the pre­
sent sewage moratorium. 

Anti-Burning Ordinance 
Council thought it bad finally 

cteared for passage an anti-burn­
ing ordinance but got snagged 
down as the measure could not get 
unanimous approval for suspe~ion 
of the rules after a minor change 
in language. The snag involved 
a proposal by Mrs. Maffay that only 
clean burning types of fuel be uti­
lized for any fires granted permis­
sion by the city manager. Coun­
cilman Dick Pilski thought this 
might be too inflexible a rule and 
opposed suspension of the rules for 
this purpose. The measure there­
fore, with the change in language, 
will have to await final passage at 
the next meeting. 

Parks and Recreation Advisory 
Board representatives also raised 
a question whether the proposed 
ordinance conflicted with State 
or county laws. Giese and city so­
licitor Emmett Nanna expressed 
their view that there was no con­
:lict. 

The proposed ordinance prohibits 
outdoor fires but provides for four 
exceptions to the ordinance. They 
are: fires in outdoor fireplaces, pit, 
grills, or stoves; small warming 
fires built in a container; small 
controlled fires, such as the burn­
ing of lighters, matches, etc.; and 
fires for which a permit has been 
issued by the city manager, provid­
ed that such fires not be for the 
burning of trash or the clearing of 
woodland. The ordinance provides 
for a fine not exceeding $100 for the 
first offense and a fine not exceed­
ing $1,000 or 90 days imprisonment 
for each subsequent offense. 

Open-Space Funds 
Council approved a resolution 

authorizing the filing of an amend­
atory application for Federal open­
space funds to help acquire part 
of pa.reel 7 and parcel 8 (land near 
entrance to Boxwood Village). T h e 
city estimates the cost of acquiring 
both parcels will be $238,145, half 
of which it hopes to receive from 
the Federal Government. 

Ordlna.nces Introduced 
Council introduced for first 

reading an ordinance repealing 
present ordinances relating to the 
establishment of a special taxing 
district for the Greenbelt commen­
cial center. This was necessitated 
by a Prince Georges Circuit Court 
ruling which declared the special 
taxing district as not valid. The 
oity will also refund all taxes paid 
under these previous ordinances. 
A new ordinance dealing with the 
matter is being prepared. 

Also introduced for first read­
ing was a resolution transferring 
funds from contingency and other 
reserve accounts to cover addition­
al expenditures in the parks and 
_playgrounds, engineering, and in­
surance accounts. 

Stat.e Legislation 
Council went on record favoring 

State legislation providing for rev­
enue sharing with municipalities, 
rebat'e of motor fuel taxes paid by 
mun icipalities, extension from 90 to 
120 days of the deadline for citizens 
filling damage suits against mu­
nicipalities, and a r eview of tax 
exemption measures for t he aged. 

Parking 
Giess recommended to council 

that city action on petition by 
Southway residents for off-street 
driveway entrances await the de­
cision of Gm as to whether It will 
permit off-street parking in the 
Souhtway area. 

Other Matters 
The city is planning a special 

registration in May for city voters 
desiring to vote in September's City 
election . • • Gies.e was asked to 
study the des irabUlty of placing 

GREENBELT NEWS REVIEW 

Recreation Review 
Bumper Pool Tournament 

This popular game will hold 
competition for Boys and Girls at 
the Youth Center. The tournament 
will be held Saturday, March 20, 
from 9 a.m. to 12 noon. Age cate­
gories are: 12, 15, and 18 and Un­
der. Drop by the Youth Center 
and fill out a registration form to 
enter. 

Greenbelt Chucks 
Greenbelt Chucks will conclude 

its indoor program on Saturday, 
March 20, at both St. Hugh's, and 
Springhill ,Lake Elementary School. 
Check this column for future de­
tails of our Tee-League (Baseball 
Program) for elementary aged boys. 

City Bowling Champion 
Fred Ford_ (55 Ridge Road) cap­

tured city honors by becoming 
Greenbelt's first bowling champion. 
Fred rolled a 531 scratch set while 
Ken Nelson followed with a dis­
tant 489 set. Fred's high game was 
a 196. The Tournament was spon­
sored by the Greenbelt Recreation 
Department and held at the Green­
belt Bow and Bowl. 

Kit.e Flying -Meet 
Are you 16 or under? Like to 

fly kites? - Good! The Greenbelt 
Recreation Department is having 
a KITE FLYING CONTEST on 
Saturday, March 27, on Braden 
Field directly behind the recreation 
center. Events will include prizes 
for the steadiest flying kite (with 
and without tails), most artistic, 
largest kite, smallest kite, an alti­
tude race, a kite war, longest flying 
kite, and most unusual. For fur­
ther information call 474-6878. 

Girls' and Women's Gym 
Teen Girls' Gym (7-8:30 p.m.) 

and Women's Gym (8:30-10 p.m.) 
will be held at St. Hugh's every 
Tuesday evening. Program is free 
and there is no registration. Come 
in comfortable clothes for active 
participation. 

Sunday Open G7Dl 
Sunday night, from 7 - 10 p.m. 

there will be open gym at Center 
Elementary School. 

Volunteers leeded 
For Health Dept 

The Prince Georges County 
Health Department has an urgent 
need for more volunteers. Especial­
ly needed at this time are volun­
teers to serve in child health 
clinics; volunteers who can pro­
vide morning and afternoon trans­
portation for patients at the Psy­
chiatric Day Treatment Center in 
the Celtic Building on Kenilworth 
Avenue near Riverdale Road; and 
volunteers who can file, research 
records, and perform other clerical 
tasks. No typing or shorttiand is 
required for the latter positions, 
most of which are in the Bureau 
of Maternal and Child Health. 

If you can help, please call Mike 
Gallagher, Coordinator of Volun­
teer Services, at 773-1400, Ext. 435. 

Child Development 
Lab at High Point 

The senior home economics stu­
dents of High Point Senior High 
School on Powder Mill Road, Belts­
ville, will hold their annual Child 
Development Lab for children ag­
es 2, 3, 4. The nine week session 
will be held from March 29, to May 
28. There are two sessions; 9:45 
to 10:50 a.m. and 1:40 to 3:20 p.m. 

Registration will be held · at the 
school in Room 116 on March 16 
from 9:30 to 10:30 a.m. Applications 
can be obtained after this date 
from the main office and must be 
returned by March 22. Children 
will be accepted according to age, 
sex, and order of application. Par­
ents will be n otified if their child 
has been accepted by March 24. 

Transportation must be provided 
by the parents. There wlll be a 
small fee for r efreshments. 

stop signs along Crescent Road so 
as to aid pedestrians c rossing the 
street . . . Attending last Mon­
day's meeting were students from 
Dr. Lee Brown's journalism class 
at th~ University of Maryland. 
(Does anybody want an experience­
rewarding job with the News Re­
view? - Ed.) 
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Boys'-Girls' Club News 
By John Armstrong 

Boys interested in playing 
G.B.G.C. baseball must be between 
the ages of 13 and 18. Sign-up for 
the 1971 season will take place dur­
ing the week of March 29 through 
April 2, times being 6:30 p.m. to 10 
p.m. at the Greenbelt Youth 
Center. 

Practice begins April 12. Those 
boys who are going out for school 
teams are urged to sign up, since 
county competition doesn't actual­
ly begin until June 1. 

Girls' softball is being offered to 
all Greenbelt girls between the 
ages of 8 through 18. Sign-up will 
begin at the same time and same 
place as the boys' sign-up. Parents 
are urged to get their youngsters 
to participate in the baseball sea­
son. 

Men and women interested in 
coaching a boys' baseball team or 
girls' softball team should contact 
Joe Wilkinson, Athletic Director of 
G.B.G.C. within the next two 
weeks. Please write P.O. Box 142, 
Greenbelt, or call 474-6893. 

Meeting dates: G.B.G.C. meet­
ings are held on the fourth Tues­
day of each month at 8 p.m. The 
meeting place is the Greenbelt 
Municipal Building, usually in the 
council room. The next meeting 
is scheduled for March 23. All 
parents are urged to attend. 

Girls' B-Ball 

The 15 and under girls' team 
ended in a tie for 3rd at the end 
of the .first half with a 6-3 record. 
The girls lost their bid for first 
place after losing the last two 
games of the half. 

Lou-Ann Raley is the top player 
on the team, scoring 74 points in 
8 games. Other standouts are: 
Rita Baluch, Donna DeBethizy and 
Donna Linck. 

The two other girls' teams, ll's 
and 13's, are not faring too well 
but continue to enjoy the fun and 
tr.avel. 

Sue Smith has proved herself a 
fine rebounder and is high scorer 
on the 13's. Charlene Messer is 
considered a super-sub by her 
coach and Julie Jenkins is another 
fine player. 

Tax Returns Prepared 
In your home by experieneecl 
tax consultant. Rea.sonable rates. 

FREE photocopy 
All Work Guarant,eed 

Call FREDERICK J. ISAACS 
"THE TAX RECORDER" 

474-1005 
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Greenbelt Homes, Inc. JUST ARRIVED! 
Sales Office located on 

Hamll$on Place 
Ice Chests 
12 qt. Cooler 

96c & up 
77c WITH Spring just around the 

comer, wouldn't you like to 
move your family to a home 
with a yard where you can 
plant flowers, enjoy outdoor 
barbecues and picnics? 

Boys' Short Sleeve 
Shirt & Tie Sets $1.77 

Size 4-'1 

START shopping now - - - come 
in and see om selection of two 
and three bedroom brick and 
frame homes. Improvements 
and many extras. 

Boy's Short Sleeve 
Shirts $ 1.99 

Size 6-18 

.A!FTER down payment, monthly 
charge covers everything except 
elec. & phone. 

Infants Diaper Sets $2.99 
For Boys & Girls S-M-L 

SAIL.ES OFFICE open 7 days a 
week - come in and talk with 
our sales staff about purchasing 
a Gm townhouse. 

Nylon Bikinis 2 pr $1.00 

Snug Treds $1 .99 & $2.99 
For m.-n, women & children 

MAKE your selection NOW ... 
LOOK forward to occupying 
your home this Spring. 

C,entral Oharge - BankAmerica.rd 

FOR information call 474-4161, 
or 474-4244 

Ben Franklin 
In The C,enter 

Mary E. Dixon 
Broker 

Open 9-9 Mon.-sat. 

Greenbelt Carry-out 
SATURDAY & SUNDAY, MARCH 13 & M 

SMALL CHEESE PIZZA .............................................. 65 

SHOCKBURGER ............................................................ .45 
GOLDEN JOE SPECIAL .......................................... .65 
THE ITALIAN BLAST .................................................... 75 

107 Centerway Open Sunday 474-4998 

Will's Hardware 
10502 Baltimore Ave. (Route 1) Beltsville 

(Chestnut Hills Shopping Cent.er) 

SACRETE, PORTLAND CEMENTS 
PLUMBING, PIPE CUT TO SIZE 

GLASS, STORM WINDOWS AND SCREENS REPAIRED 
CURTAIN RODS - DRAPERY RODS MADE TO ORDER 

1,301 PAINT COLORS MIXED TO ORDER 

FULL LINE OF GARDEN SUPPLIES 

Open Sunday 9 :00 AM to 1 :00 PM 

474-2200 

"NOW SERVING GREENBELT 
AND SURROUNDING AREAS" 

L & K Inc. 
T / A Leary's Auto Service 

VOLKSWAGEN REPAIRS 
Servicing All Makes & Models 

• Motor Tune Up • Bra ke Service 
• Electric Work • Wheel Alig nment 
• Complete Motor Overhaul 

Automatic Transmission Service 
Fadory Tra ined Mechanics 

Md. Inspection Station 

345-5613 
20 Southway Rd. Greenbelt, Md. 

"Just Off Balto-Wash. Pai:kway" 

15% LABOR DISCOUNT ON TUNE UP 
DUIHNG MONTH OF MARCH 

Veterans Cut•Rate Liquors 
11620 Baltimore Blvd. (Route I ) Beltsville, Md. 

PRE-SPRING WEEK END HALF GALLON SPECIALS 
Harveys' Scotch 
King James Scotch 
Bacardi Rum 
Walkers Gin 
Smirnoff Vodka 

$10.49 
$8.49 
$9.29 
$7.99 
$8.99 

Wolfschmidrs Vodka­
Jamie 08 Scotch 
Canadian Host 
Bourbon Supreme 
Don Q Rum 

$7.19 
$10.49 

$8.99 
$8.49 
$7.99 

IMPORTED ALIANCA ROSE' WINE -
937-1110 

$119 quart 
937-3022 
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